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Ref: FOI / 5702 Chathair Dhoire &

Cheantar an tSratha Bain

Derry Cittie & Strabane
Destrick Cooncll

22n May 2025

Email:

Dear

Freedom of Information Act 2000 Request - Fly-Tipping Offences

| refer to your FOI request and respond as follows:

I am writing to request information regarding fly-tipping offences between
January 2022 and March 2025. Please provide the following details:

1. The number of recorded fly-tipping incidents per year from January
2022 to February 2025-broken down by month and year. Including if
possible:

a. Age of offender (e.g. under 18, 18-24, 25-34, 35-44, 45-54, 55-64, 65+)
a. Council do not hold this information.

b. Gender of offender
a. Available only where the offender has been identified as per the
enclosed.

c. A brief description of what took place (if possible).
¢ Actions taken (Fines, clean-up costs and prosecutions etc)

e Object fly-tipped (white goods, building waste, mattresses etc)
e Location (Urban, Rural, Layby, National Park etc)

Derry Strabane



Council does not hold this information for each specific incident  In the majority of
incident the waste within urbans area comprises mainly household items i.e. white
goods, furniture and refuse sacks. Waste found in more rural areas tends to be more
building type waste

If you are dissatisfied with our response, you have rights of review and appeal; these
rights consist of two review processes.

Firstly, our internal review procedure is available by contacting:

John Kelpie

Chief Executive

Derry City and Strabane District Council

98 Strand Road

Derry BT48 7NN

Tel: 028 71253253 or email: john kelpie@derrystrabane.com

Secondly, you can appeal directly by contacting the Information Commissioner at:

Information Commissioner

Wycliffe House

Water Lane

Wilmslow

CHESHIRE SK9 5AF

Tel: 0303 123 1113 (local rate) or email: casework@ico.orqg.uk

I would however advise that the Information Commissioner has indicated that a
review will not be undertaken unless the Council has first had an opportunity to re-
consider its decision.

Yours sincerely

Conor Canning
Head of Environment & Building Control



Month No of Incidents Fines Prosecutions M/F Clean Up Costs

Jan-22 185 0 0 £5,676.97
Feb-22 169 1 0 £3,324.50
Mar-22 206 8 0 £4,068.17
Apr-22 256 3 1 F £4,286.43
May-22 209 9 5 3F, 2M £3,746.47
Jun-22 183 2 0 £4,572.42
Jul-22 152 2 0 £3,243.09
Aug-22 174 4 2 F £3,027.68
Sep-22 185 1 0 £4,363.38
Oct-22 184 4 0 £3,258.62
Nov-22 158 1 0 £3,599.03
Dec-22 135 1 0 £3,179.49
Jan-23 135 4 1 M £3,002.80
Feb-23 176 2 2 1M, 1F £3,184.97
Mar-23 180 1 1 F £4,317.80
Apr-23 135 1 0 £3,056.13
May-23 191 1 0 £3,745.23
Jun-23 199 3 1 M £4,543.27
Jul-23 224 1 1 F £3,559.10
Aug-23 215 2 0 £4,346.19
Sep-23 210 3 0 £3,251.28
Oct-23 224 5 0 £3,777.57
Nov-23 227 4 1 F £4,032.32
Dec-23 130 3 4 1M, 3F £2,730.08
Jan-24 201 2 0 £2,691.39
Feb-24 200 1 0 £3,889.01
Mar-24 201 0 0 £3,550.48
Apr-24 256 3 0 £3,789.75
May-24 232 1 1 F £5,104.25
Jun-24 143 7 1 F £3,173.00
Jul-24 175 4 1 M £3,797.00
Aug-24 165 1 0 £4,934.40
Sep-24 157 2 0 £3,773.00
Oct-24 151 4 2 M £3,694.10
Nov-24 150 0 0 £3,484.80
Dec-24 105 0 0 £3,638.00
Jan-25 142 6 0 £3,296.60
Feb-25 120 0 0 £3,201.90






