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Freedom of Information Act 2000 Request - Dual Street Signage

| refer to your FOI request and respond as follows:

1. Please state the total number of streets in the Derry and Strabane council
area (as defined for the purpose of considering applications for dual-
medium English-Irish street signage).

2275

2. Please state how many of these streets currently have dual-medium English-
Irish street signage.

254 (131 DCC & 123 DCSDCQ)

3. Please state the number of streets in the council area where residents were
consulted on erecting dual-medium English-Irish street signage on their
street, but which did not meet the required threshold for signage to be
erected.

181 (158 DCC & 23 DCSDCQ)
4. Please state the number of streets in the council area where a consultation
on dual-medium street signage is pending and has not occurred yet.

101

Strabane



5. If possible, please provide
a. A list of streets in the council area
Council cannot provide the information requested as this is held under licence
and cannot be shared. The data is available through the Pointer product held

by Land and Property Services who can be contacted using the following link:

https://www.finance-ni.gov.uk/topics/ordnance-survey-northern-ireland

b. The number of residents recorded on the electoral roll on each street
within the boundary of the council area

Council does not hold this information. Information only available from:
Electoral Office for Northern Ireland,

Colby House

Stranmillis Court

Belfast

BT9 5TA

c. The length of each street within the boundary of the council area.

Information not held. Where Council officers suspect that a street is close to 5
miles long or more, we can use various GIS applications to measure the length
of the street to follow the correct procedure.

If you are dissatisfied with our response, you have rights of review and appeal; these
rights consist of two review processes.

Firstly, our internal review procedure is available by contacting:

John Kelpie

Chief Executive

Derry City and Strabane District Council

98 Strand Road

Derry BT48 7NN

Tel: 028 71253253 or email: john.kelpie@derrystrabane.com



https://www.finance-ni.gov.uk/topics/ordnance-survey-northern-ireland
mailto:john.kelpie@derrystrabane.com

Secondly, you can appeal directly by contacting the Information Commissioner at:

Information Commissioner

Wycliffe House

Water Lane

Wilmslow

CHESHIRE SK9 5AF

Tel: 0303 123 1113 (local rate) or email: casework@ico.org.uk

| would however advise that the Information Commissioner has indicated that a
review will not be undertaken unless the Council has first had an opportunity to re-
consider its decision.

Yours sincerely

Conor Canning
Head of Environment & Building Control
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